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EXHIBITOR 
REGISTRATION 

FORM

JUNE 6 – 8  |   DALL AS T X

SPONSORSHIP 
OPPORTUNITY
•	FOOT INNOVATE SPONSOR* - $9,900

	– Exhibitor booth directly in academic 
meeting space.

	– 5-min presentation to conference attendees 
during one of the academic sessions.

	– Exhibitor access to all social events.

	– Ad in final 2024 conference e-program.

	– Pre-conference attendee mailing list (mailer 
must be approved by Foot Innovate by 
May 15, 2024).

	– Three exhibitor badges.

	– Pre- and post-registration attendee lists 
provided in electronic format.

	– Company name and logo on event signage, 
meeting website, and in final program 
(description and link to your website).

*Non-Foot Innovate Sponsor Price $14,500.
$2,500 non-refundable deposit due with application.

ADDITIONAL 
OPPORTUNITIES
•	INDUSTRY LAB SPONSORSHIP - 

$4,500
	– Limited availability. Opportunities available 

Friday and Saturday.

	– Labs will be listed in the program, mobile 
app, on the meeting website, and will receive 
locater signage and branding during the 
conference.

	– Dedicated pre-conference e-blast to meeting 
attendees to drive lab registration (sent by 
Foot Innovate; company provides artwork).

•	GENERAL SESSION SYMPOSIUM - 
$4,000
	– Part of the General Session. Industry 

Symposiums will be listed in the program, 
mobile app, and on the meeting website.

	– Estimated attendance of 100+ surgeons and 
allied health professionals.

	– Dedicated pre-conference e-blast.

	– Company designs program on a topic relevant 
to the field of foot & ankle surgery. Course 
Leadership must approve draft program.

	– Company selects faculty and is responsible 
for their travel expenses.

•	ADDITIONAL EXHIBITOR BADGES - 
$900

A portion of our proceeds from the conference will be donated to Steps2Walk.
If you have any questions, please contact Beverly Williams at bwilliams@footinnovate.com.
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